
Bid Tab - Custodian Equipment & Consumable Supplies -  2024-2025
Key Accepted Bid Rejected Sample

No Subs 
Allowed

Item# Item Description U/M BRAND PROD #
Sub 

Allowed
Sample 
Required

EST. QTY Per Item ATS Brady Plus Buckeye Cambridge Clayton Paper HD Supply Hillyard Imperial Bag Interboro Packing Nu-Life Labs, Inc. Pacific Star Office Products Alliance Pur-O-Zone Pyramid School Products Royal Paper
Vendor Accepted 

Bid
Vendor Accepted $

Equipment

Auto Scrubber & Burnishers

A-01

Walk-Behind 
SC500 20" - 

Include Battery & 
Pad Holder

Each Advance 56384686 NO NO 5 56384686 - $7,081.88 $7,339.00 $7,603.79
T20-SC 150AH 
AGM Batteries - 

$8,015.83
$6,777.29 $6,537.50 IC-I20NBVLA - $4,495

Pur-O-Zone 
& Royal 
Paper

$6,537.50 & 
$4,495

A-02

Walk-Behind 
SC750 26" - 

Include Battery & 
Pad Holder

Each Advance 56112397 NO NO 3 561123974 - $12,148.99 $12,095.00 $13,044.32
T26-SC 150 AH 
AGM Batteries - 

$9,848.02
$9,535.52 $12,558.88 IC-I28BT-LA - $10,995

Hillyard, 
Imperial Bag 

& Royal 
Paper

$9848.02, 
$9,535.52 & 

$10,995

A-03
KIT PARA 40 

SHORE FOR T20SC
Each Trident HIL227173 YES NO 10 $123.80 Hillyard  $123.80

A-04
SC 750 - Auto 

Scrubber Tan Gum 
 Set of 2 56112330 YES NO 10 56112330 - $39.27 $40.23 $41.85 GSQ1065T272 - $28.95 Brady Plus & 

Royal Paper
$39.27 & 

$28.95

A-05
Propane Burnisher 

Low Rider Dust 
Control - 21"

YES NO 4 420BU21B5VX - $5,465.05

Aztec Low Rider 
070-21-LRD - 

$4,611.76

Onyx JX1-700 - 
$2,995

Mercury Floor 
Machines, DC 21-
2000 - $1,633.04

$4,157.44 070-21-LRD - $4,298

Imperial Bag, 
Pacific Star, 
Pur-O-Zone 

& Royal 
Paper

$2,995, 
$1,633.04, 

$4,157.44 & 
$4,298

A-06
Propane Burnisher 

Low Rider Dust 
Control - 24"

YES NO 4 420BU24BSVX - $5,531.70

Aztec Low Rider 
07-24-LRD - 

$4,641.17

Onyx JX4-700 - 
$2,995 $4,186.94 070-24-LRD - $4,324

Imperial Bag, 
Pur-O-Zone 

& Royal 
Paper

$2,995, 
$4,186.94 & 

$4,324

A-07
Propane Burnisher  

Low Rider Dust 
Control- 27"

YES NO 4 420BU28BSVX - $5,598.35

Aztec Low Rider 
070-27-LRD - 

$4,670.58

Onyx JX4-700 - 
$2,995 $4,216.44 070-27-LRD - $4,350

Imperial Bag, 
Pur-O-Zone 

& Royal 
Paper

$2,995, 
$4,216.44 & 

$4,350

24"

A-08
Machine, Floor 

20" 175 rpm
Each Viper VIPVN2015 YES YES 10 $880.01 VN2015 - $714.52

Karcher BD 
51/175 - 
$954.98

$683.79

$695.00

VIPVN2015 - $921

Brady Plus, 
Imperial Bag, 
Pur-O-Zone 

& Royal 
Paper

$714.52, 
$683.79, $695 

& $921

A-09

Whirlamatic VS 20 
Dust Collector 

Bags (6 per 
package)

Pack Advance 391185 YES NO 2
Karcher 

51/2000C - 
$1,784.13

Hillyard $1,784.13

A-10

Bissell ProHeat 2X 
Revolution Max 

Clean Pet Pro Full-
Size Carpet 

Cleaner, 1986, 
with Antibacterial 

Formula and 
Bonus 3" Tough 

Stain Tool

Each Bissell 1986 NO NO 5 No Bid No Bid

A-11
Bag Dust 2000 

Burnisher
Each WIN86215070 YES YES 20 No Bid No Bid

Vacuum & Supplies 0

A-12
Vacuum, Upright 

SC886
Each Sanitaire 886 YES YES 25 SC886 - $210.80 SC886 - 

$224.90
$184.14

Sanitare 886 - 
$237.49

Sanitaire, SC886G - 
$336.33 SN886 - $220

Brady Plus, 
Imperial Bag 

& Royal 
Paper

$210.80, 
$184.14 & 

$220

A-13
Vacuum Bags, 

SC886 
Case Sanitaire 63262 B NO NO 5 63262-B -$56.87 63262-B - 

$57.49/50 pk
Sanitare 684 - 

$213.11

Sanitaire, EUR 
63262-10. 10- ct - 

$109.19
SN63262B- 5/pk - $3.42 Brady Plus & 

Royal Paper $56.87 & $3.42

A-14

Vacuum Bags - 
Tornado- CV38 

Vacuum Bags (10 
per pack)

Pack Tornado K69042940 YES NO 20 K69042940 - $8.51
Green klean, GK-
CV30-P, 10/pk - 

$16.58
$7.95 GKCV30 - $13.15

Brady Plus, 
Pur-O-Zone 

& Royal 
Paper

$8.51, $7.95 & 
$13.15

A-15
Motor intake Filter 

- Tornado- CV38 
Vacuum Bags

Each Tornado K57316110 YES NO 20 K57316110 - $1.90
Tornado, 

K57316110, each - 
$5.77

$1.75 XXTOK57316110 - $1.89

Brady Plus, 
Pur-O-Zone 

& Royal 
Paper

$1.90, $1.75 & 
$1.89

A-16
HEPA Filter - 

Tornado- CV38 
Vacuum Bags

Each Tornado K64147600 YES NO 20 K69043050 - $12.09
/pk 10/pk

Tornado, 
K64147600, each - 

$20.27
$6.95 XXTOK64147600 - $7.65

Pur-O-Zone 
& Royal 
Paper

$6.95 & $7.65

A-17

Filter H.E.P.A. 
Twin Pack-

Proteam Super 
Coach Pro

Each ProTeam 107315 YES NO 40 $13.66 107315 - $12.50 $17.07 ProTeam, 107315, 
2/pk - $18.05 $12.81

ATS, Brady 
Plus & Royal 

Paper

$13.66, $12.50 
& $12.81

A-18

Replacement 
Extension Cord-
Proteam Super 

Coach Pro

Each ProTeam 101678 NO NO 20 $53.53 101678 - $36.40 $49.64 Proteam, 101678, 
each - $49.44 RL16-50-EXT - $28.53 Brady Plus & 

Royal Paper
$36.40 & 

$28.53

A-19
Vacuum Bags - 

Super Coach Pro 
6qt -10/pkg

Package ProTeam 107314 NO NO 40 107314 - $15.05 $22.58 Proteam, 107314, 
10/pk - $19.78 $9.89 $15.53

Brady Plus, 
Pur-O-Zone 

& Royal 
Paper

$15.05, $9.89 
& $15.53

A-20

Vacuum Bags - 
Super Coach Pro 
10qt (107303)-10

/pkg 

Package ProTeam 107313 NO NO 20 107313 - $18.21 $27.32 Proteam, 107313, 
10/pk - $23.73 $11.96 $18.79 Pur-O-Zone 

& Brady Plus 11.96 & $18.21

A-21
Vacuum Bags - 

Super Coach 6qt 
(107314)-10/pkg 

Package ProTeam 107314 NO NO 20 107314 - $15.05 $22.58 Proteam, 107314, 
10/pk - $24.47 $9.89 $15.53 Brady Plus & 

Pur-O-Zone $15.05 & $9.89

A-22 Bags Each Eureka 53354-3 YES YES 10 $10.37 ATS $10.37

A-23 Belts Each Eureka 30563A YES YES 400 $11.00 Eureka, 30563A. 
10/pl - $16.20 ATS $11.00

A-24 Cords Each Eureka 52370-12 YES YES 10 Eureka, 52370-12, 
each - $65.60 Pacific Star $65.60
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A-25
Eureka - Sanitaire - 

Beater Bars 12" 
VGII Ball Brg

Each Eureka 53270 NO NO 50 Eureka, 53270, 
each - $33.40 Pacific Star $33.40

Vacuum, Wet/Dry 0

A-26
Wet/Dry Vac 

VL500 55 14 Gal 
(No Substitute)

Each ADVANCE ADV107409093 NO NO 5 107409093 - 
$674.67 $655.00 Trident WD21V - 

$851.84 $600.46 $638.95 Imperial Bag 
& Pur-O-one

$600.46 & 
$638.95

Waste Collection 0

A-27
Mobile Collection 

Equipment Tilt 
Truck 1 Cu Yd

Each YES NO 5 $787.29 FG13400BLA - 
$552.04

RCP1305-73 
- $890.70

Rubbermaid 
1314 - Black - 

$425.36

Tough Guy, 
21VK40, each - 

$810.68
$443.60

Rubbermaid 
FG9T1400BLA - 

$559.98

RMFG131400BLA - 
$432.78

Imperial Bag 
& Royal 
Paper

$425.36 & 
$432.78

A-28
Mobile Collection 

Equipment Tilt 
Truck 1/2 Cu Yd

Each Rubbermaid 1305-73 YES NO 15 $580.27 FG130573BLUE - 
$731.15

RCP1305-73 
- $890.70 $780.59

Rubbermaid 
1304 - Black - 

$297.17

RCP13057BLU - 
$889.98

Rubbermaid, 
FG130573Blue, 
each - $1,082.70

$310.51
Rubbermaid 

FG9T1400BLA - 
$559.98

RMFG130400BLA - 
$302.94

Imperial Bag, 
Pur-O-Zone 

& Royal 
Paper

$297.17, 
$310.51 & 

$302.94

Floor Care Equipment & Supplies

Brushes/Brooms

A-29 Brooms, Angle Each YES YES 100 $8.35 AD0077 - $7.95 BRA39S - 
$6.52

By case of 6 
Only 

RUB6385GY - 
$152.76

BWK932AEA - 
$7.97

ABCO BR1024MH - 
12/each case/full 
case only - $4.89

/each

RL-LG-ANGBRM - $5.85

Clayton 
Paper, 

Pyramid 
School 

Products & 
Royal Paper

$6.52, $4.89 & 
$5.85

A-30
Broom, Libman, 
11" path(name 

brand)
Each  YES YES 15 BRA39S - 

$6.52
Clayton 
Paper $6.52

Dust Mop-Frame, Handle & Heads 0

A-31
Frame, Dust Mop 

5" X 18" Quick 
Change

Each Golden Star YES YES 10 $1.44 KL650167 - $2.43 FQC18 - 
$2.69 BWK1418 - $4.71

ABCO BH24518WF 
- 6/each full case 
only - $2.99/each

RL5X18 FRAME - $5.28

ATS, Brady 
Plus & 
Clayton 
Paper

$1.44, $2.43 & 
$2.69

A-32
Frame, Dust Mop 

5" X 18" Quick 
Change

Each Hillyard HIL52813 YES YES 10 $1.44 FQC18 - 
$2.69 $2.75 BWK1418 - $4.71 RL5X18 FRAME - $5.28

ATS, Clayton 
Paper & 
Hillyard

$1.44, $2.69 & 
$2.75

A-33
Frame, Dust Mop 

5" X 24" Quick 
Change

Each Golden Star YES YES 10 $1.63 KL650168 - $2.73 $48.00 FQC24 - 
$2.88 BWK1424 - $4.89

ABCO BH24524WF 
- 6/each full case 
only - $3.99/each

RL5X24 FRAME - $5.00

ATS, Brady 
Plus & 
Clayton 
Paper

$1.63, $2.73 & 
$2.88

A-34
Frame, Dust Mop 

5" X 24" Quick 
Change

Each Hillyard HIL52815 YES YES 10 $1.63 FQC24 - 
$2.88 $3.10 BWK1424 - $4.89 RMFGM253000000 - 

$3.85

ATS, Clayton 
Paper & 
Hillyard

$1.63, $2.88 & 
$3.10

A-35
Frame, Dust Mop 

5" x 36" Quick 
Change

Each Golden Star YES YES 10 $1.93 KL650169 - $3.54 $67.00 FQC36 - 
$3.51 BWK1436 - $5.89

ABCO BH24536WF 
- 6/each full case 
only - $4.79/each

RL5X36 FRAME - $6.19
ATS & 
Clayton 
Paper

$1.93 & $3.51

A-36
Frame, Dust mop 

5" X 36" Quick 
Change

Each Hillyard HIL52817 YES YES 10 $1.93 FQC36 - 
$3.51 $3.78 BWK1436 - $5.89 RMFGM255000000 - 

$5..21

ATS, Clayton 
Paper & 
Hillyard

$1.93, $3.51 & 
$3.78

A-37
Frame, Dust Mop 

5" x 60" Quick 
Change

Each Golden Star YES YES 10 $3.20 KL650173 - $6.35 FQC60 - 
$5.90 BWK1460 - $7.99

ABCO BH24560WF 
- 6/each full case 
only - $8.99/each

RL5X60 FRAME - $9.69
ATS & 
Clayton 
Paper

$3.20 & $5.90

A-38
Frame, Dust Mop 

5" X 60" Quick 
Change

Each Hillyard HIL52821 YES YES 10 $3.20 FQC60 - 
$5.90 $5.92 BWK1460 - $7.99 RL5X60 FRAME - $9.69

ATS, Clayton 
Paper & 
Hillyard

$3.20, $5.90 & 
$5.92

A-39
Handles, Dust 

Mop Quick Change 
60 IN WOOD

Each Hillyard HIL22608 YES YES 10 $16.54 HQC160 - 
$7.29 $11.05 BWK1490 - $9.41 ABCO 01406NB - 

$6.69/each RL60DM HDCF - $8.69

Clayton 
Paper, 

Hillyard, Nu-
Lif Labs, Inc., 

Pyramid 
School 

Products & 
Royal Paper

$7.29, $11.05, 
$9.41, $6.69 & 

$8.69

A-40
Mop, Dust Infinity, 

Twist, Cotton, 
BLUE - 5" X 18"

Each Hillyard HIL53402 NO NO 10 $5.14 Hillyard $5.14

A-41
Mop, Dust Infinity, 

Twist, Cotton, 
BLUE - 5" X 18"

Each YES YES 10 $8.54 KL650156 - $3.82 AJU18CITBB 
- $5.29

ABCO 
DMTL125180DBL - 

$4.99/each

Brady Plus & 
Pyramid 
School 

Products

$3.82 & $4.99

A-42
Mop, Dust Infinity, 

Twist, Cotton, 
BLUE - 5" X 24"

Each Hillyard HIL53404 NO NO 10 $6.76 Hillyard $6.76

A-43
Mop, Dust Infinity, 

Twist, Cotton, 
BLUE - 5" X 24"

Each YES YES 10 $4.80 KL650157 - $4.42 AJU24CITBB 
- $6.53

ABCO 
DMTL12524DBL - 6 
each/case full case 
only - $5.99/each

ATS & Brady 
Plus $4.80 & $4.42

A-44
Mop, Dust Infinity, 

Twist, Cotton, 
BLUE - 5" X 36"

Each Hillyard HIL53406 NO NO 10 $9.63 Hillyard $9.63

A-45
Mop, Dust Infinity, 

Twist, Cotton, 
BLUE - 5" X 36"

Each YES YES 10 $6.49 KL650158 - $6.64 AJU36CITBB 
- $9.24

ABCO 
DMTL12536DBL - 6 
each/case full case 
only - $7.99/each

ATS & Brady 
Plus $6.49 & $6.64

A-46
Mop, Dust Infinity, 

Twist, Cotton, 
BLUE -5" X 60"

Each Hillyard HIL53409 NO NO 10 By Case of 6 
only - $145.63 Hillyard $145.63

A-47
Mop, Dust Infinity, 

Twist, Cotton, 
BLUE -5" X 60"

Each YES YES 10 $10.59 KL650160 - $11.14 AJU60CITBB 
- $17.09

ABCO 
DMTL12560DBL - 6 
each/case full case 
only - $10.99/each

ATS, Brady 
Plus & 

Pyramid 
School 

Products

$10.59, $11.14 
& $10.99
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A-48 Dust Mop Brush Each Rubbermaid  FG634200SILV NO NO 20 $7.02 FG6342005ILV - 
$4.02

By Case of 6 
only - $51.56 $4.84 Rubbermaid - 

$13.74
12 ea/case full case 

only - $4.69/each $4.35 Brady Plus & 
Royal Paper $4.02 & $4.35

A-49
Executive Lobby 
Broom w/vinyl 

Handle
Each Rubbermaid FG637400BLA NO NO 50 $7.93 FG637400BLA - 

$4.85
RCP637400
BLA - $10.39 $10.76 $7.48 FG637400BLA - 

$11.17/each

Rubbermiad, 
FG637400BLA, 
each - $14.85

12 ea/case full case 
only - $6.29/each $6.38

Brady Plus, 
Pyramid 
School 

Products & 
Royal Paper

$4.85, $6.29 & 
$6.38

A-50
Lobby Pro Upright 

Dust Pans - 
Rubbermaid

Each Rubbermaid FG253100 BLA NO NO 50 $15.08 FG253100BLA - 
$10.40

RCP253100
BLK - $25.97 $24.36 $15.26

Rubbermaid, 
FG253100BLA, 
each - $37.88

6 ea/case full case 
only - $8.99/each $14.29

Brady Plus & 
Pyramid 
School 

Products

$10.40 & $8.99

Floor Care, Gym

A-51
18" Lightweight T-

Bar Kit
Each Hillyard HIL50043 NO NO 10 $62.51 Hillyard $62.51

A-52
18" Lightweight T-

Bar Kit
Each YES YES 10 No Bid No Bid

A-53
18" Lightweight T-

Bar T Bar Only
Each Hillyard HIL50040 NO NO 10 $29.88 Hillyard $29.88

A-54
18" Lightweight T-

Bar T Bar Only
Each YES YES 10 No Bid No Bid

A-55
18" Lightweight T-

Bar Refill Pads
Each Hillyard HIL50041 NO NO 10 $21.18 Hillyard $21.18

A-56
18" Lightweight T-

Bar Refill Pads
Each YES YES 10 SP99187-LAB - $8.48 Royal Paper $8.48

A-57
Multi-flo XP Pad 
Set Kit (1-23" & 1-

30" pad refill)
Each Hillyard HIL50162 NO NO 10 $30.95 Hillyard $30.95

A-58
Quick Pass Towel 

Only 24" X 72"
Each Hillyard TKH210 NO NO 10 $41.83 Hillyard $41.83

A-59
Quick Pass Towel 

Only 24" X 72"
Each TKH210 YES YES 10 No Bid No Bid

A-60
Hillyard Quick Pass 

6'
Each Hillyard HIL22300 NO NO 10 $677.23 Hillyard $677.23

A-62
Handle Wood 

Lumathread 6 Ft Case/12 CSM4526800 NO NO

10 $4.29 $9.23 $139.80

Carlisle 
Foodservice, 

4526800, 12/pk - 
$107.42

$139.89 ATS & 
Hillyard $4.29 & $9.23

A-63
Screen Disc 13in 

120 Grit Case AME501213 NO NO
10 $32.00 $10.40 Hllyard & 

Imperial Bag $32 & $10.40

A-64

Pad 14X20 
Mulitfinish Prep 

MFPP Case HIL45040 NO NO
20 $104.94 $100.77 ATS & 

Hillyard
$104.94 & 

$100.77

A-65
Pad 14X20IN 
Cleaner Blue Case HIL42323 NO NO

2 $81.95 $36.23 ATS & 
Hillyard

$81.95 & 
$36.23

A-66

Pad Comp 
23&30IN for 

HIL50108 MulltiFlo 
XP Each Hillyard HIL50162 NO NO

15 $30.95 Hillyard $30.95

Wet Mopping Equipment

A-61
Wringer-Bucket 

Combo Pack
Each Impact I4Y26363Y YES YES 30 $72.89 BLOK2650 - 

$83.74 $62.66 IMP7Y26363Y - 
$82.79

4Y26353Y - 
$132.98 $109.69 Buckeye & 

Hillyard
$72.89 & 

$62.66

A-62
Wringer-Bucket 
Combo R-maid

Each Rubbermaid 7577-88 NO NO 32 $143.03 FG757788YEL - 
$124.26/each

RCPFG7577
88YEL - 
$190.90

$161.67
BWK2635 

Combo35 QT - 
$69.97

Rubbermaid, 
FG757788BRN, 
each - $196.76

$159.98 Brady Plus $124.26

Wet Mopping Equipment, Heads & Supplies

A-63

O-Cedar Quick-
Change Mop 
Handle, 60", 

Fiberglass, Yellow 

Each O'Cedar DVOCB965166EA NO NO 75 $11.65 DVOCB965166E
A - $14.51

O'Cedar, 
CB965166, each - 

$24.61

6 ea/case full case 
only - $9.98/each

RLQLRGMOF HANDLE 
- $13.13

Buckeye & 
Pyramid 
School 

Products

$11.65 & $9.98

A-64
Handle Sure Grip 
Wood 1 1/8 Wet 

Mop Each Hillyard HIL22689 NO NO

20
New P/N 

HIL22679 - 
$18.05

Hillyard $18.05

A-65
Handle Sure Grip 
Wood 1 1/8 Wet 

Mop Each YES YES
20 No Bid No Bid

A-66

Mop, Fast Track 
Finish Narrow 

Band Head Lrg. 
Blue & White Each Hillyard HIL24013 NO NO

20
$7.91

Hillyard $7.91

Doodlebug, Frame & Handle

A-67
Pads, Doodlebug - 
Brown (5/box, 4 

boxes/case)
Case 3M 70071567872 NO NO 50 $33.00

MMM08004 - 5 
per box - $11.99

/box

3M, 70071567872, 
20/pk - $58.80

Nu-Life Labs, 
Inc. $11.99

A-68

Pads, Doodlebug 
Utility Heavy Duty  
- Brown (5/box, 4 

boxes/case)

Case Hillyard HIL29960 NO NO 30 $98.91 $22.94 Hillyard $22.94

A-69
Pads, Doodlebug - 

White (5/box, 4 
boxes/case)

Case 3M 70071313418 YES YES 30 $31.90 AC541012 - 
$21.39 $33.00

MMM08003 - 5 
per box - $11.99

/box

3M, 8440, 20/ct - 
$59.80

ACS 621 - 5/box, 4 
box/case - $15.89 RL8440 - $20.63

Clayton 
Paper, Nu-
Life Labs, 

Inc., Pyramid 
School 

Products & 
Royal Paper

$21.39, $11.99, 
$15.89 & 

$20.63

A-70
Doodlebug, Pad 

Holder 
Case 3M YES YES 50 $125.60 542061 - $10.52 AC542061 - 

$13.95 $16.98 Tolco 280157 - 10 
each/case - $49.90 MN6472-LAB - $17.05

Brady Plus, 
Clayton 
Paper & 

Imperial Bag

$10.52, $13.95 
& $16.98
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A-71
Doodlebug, Pad 
Holder (10 per 

case)
Case 3M 70071312089 NO NO 50 $128.00

MMM6472BULK - 
$215.99 (10 per 
box); BWK00405 
- $79.99 (12 per 

box)

3M, 70071312089. 
10/pk - $291.71 MN6472 - $166.26

Imperial Bag 
& Nu-Life 
Labs, Inc.

$128 & $79.99

Floor Pads 0
Round Pads 0

13" 0

A-72
White Pads 
POLISH - 13"

Case 3M NO NO 30 $13.59 MMM08477 - 
$23.94 $15.80 3M08477 - 

$19.99
3M, 4100, 5/pk - 

$27.40 MN4100WH - $19.09 ATS & 
Imperial Bag

$13.59 & 
$15.80

A-73
White Pads 
POLISH -13"

Case Not 3M YES YES 30 $7.87 AC401213 - 
$11.90

Part Number 
HIL42013 - 

$13.17

BWK4013WHI - 
$8.95 ACS 41-13 - $7.99 RL-WHPOLISH13 - 

$7.75

ATS, Clayton 
Paper, Nu-
Life Labs, 

Inc., Pyramid 
School 

Products & 
Royal Paper

$7.87, $11.90, 
$8.95, $7.99 & 

$7.75

A-74
Red Pad BUFFING - 

13"
Case 3M NO NO 30 $13.59 MMM44914 - 

$23.94 $15.80 3M, 5100, 5/pk - 
$27.40

ATS & 
Imperial Bag

$13.59 & 
$15.80

A-75
Red Pad BUFFING - 

13"
Case Not 3M YES YES 30 $7.87 AC404413 - 

$11.90

Part Number 
HIL42113 - 

$13.17

BWK4013RED - 
$8.95 ACS 51-13 - $7.99

ATS, Clayton 
Paper, Nu-
Life Labs, 

Inc. & 
Pyramid 
School 

Products

$7.87, $11.90, 
$8.95 & $7.99

A-76
Black Pads STRIP - 

13"
Case 3M NO NO 50 $13.13 MMM08375 - 

$29.90 $15.80 AMF404413 - 
$11.61

3M, 7200, 5/pk - 
$28.09

ATS & Nu-
Life Labs, 

Inc.

$13.13 & 
$11.61

A-77
Black Pads STRIP - 

13"
Case Not 3M YES YES 50 $7.87 AC400113 - 

$11.90

Part Number 
HIL42713 - 

$13.17

BWK4013BLA - 
$8.95 ACS 72-13 - $7.99 RL-BLKSTRIP13 - $8.46

ATS, 
Pyramid 
School 

Products & 
Royal Paper

$7.87, $7.99 & 
$8.46

20" 0

A-78
White Pads 
POLISH - 20"

Case 3M NO NO 30 $25.91 MMM08484 - 
$41.46 $27.70 3M - $34.71/case 3M, 4100, 5/pk - 

$50.63
ATS & 

Imperial Bag
$25.91 & 

$27.70

A-79
White Pads 
POLISH - 20"

Case Not 3M YES YES 30 $15.07 AC401220 - 
$21.20

Part Number 
HIL42020 - 

$25.09

BWK4020WHI - 
$18.57/case ACS 41-20 - $13.09 RL-WHPOISH20 - 

$29.53

ATS, Clayton 
Paper & 
Pyramid 
School 

Products

$15.07, $21.20 
& $13.09

A-80
Red Pad BUFFING - 

20"
Case 3M NO NO 50 $34.87 MMM0395 - 

$41.46 $27.70 3M - $34.71/case 3M, 5100, 5/pk - 
$50.63

Imperial Bag 
& Nu-Life 
Labs, Inc.

$27.70 & 
$34.71

A-81
Red Pad BUFFING - 

20"
Case Not 3M YES YES 50 $15.07 AC404420 - 

$21.20

Part Number 
HIL42220 - 

$25.09

NL311101-
401920 - $19.99

/case
ACS 51-20 - $13.09

ATS, Clayton 
Paper, Nu-
Life Labs, 

Inc. & 
Pyramid 
School 

Products

$15.07, $21.20, 
$19.99 & 

$13.09

A-82
Black Pads STRIP - 

20"
Case Amerco - Elite AC400120 NO NO 50 $15.13 AC400120 - 

$21.20 $27.70 31020 - $23.99
/case

Americao, 400120, 
5/pk - $33.36

ATS, Clayton 
Paper & Nu-
Life Labs, 

Inc.

$15.13, $21.20 
& $23.99

A-83
21" Beige - 

Burnisher Pad
Case Hillyard HIL42521 YES YES 50 $68.20 AC401521 - 

$26.85 $29.81 ACS 42-21 - $14.15
Clayton 
Paper & 
Hillyard

$26.85 & 
$29.81

28" 0

A-84
Twister Green 

Diamond Cleaning 
System

Box/2 435528 YES YES 10 AC35528 - 
$189.90

AC5-ETC-3000 
(Green) - $125.99 
(Box of 2); 3000 

Grit Triple S 
Brand 30336 - 

$119.99 (Box of 
2)

Nu-Life Labs, 
Inc.

$125.99 & 
$119.99

Flooring 0

A-85

Gator Supreme w 
Ultraflex Edge 3 X 

3 (52 oz face 
weight 92oz over 

all weight ultra 
flex edging)

Each Gator MAT999GS NO NO 5 $141.84 Hillyard $141.84

A-86

Gator Supreme w 
ultraflex Edge 3 X 

5 (52 oz face 
weight 92oz over 

all weight ultra 
flex edging)

Each Gator MAT999GS NO NO 5 $215.84 Hillyard $215.84

A-87

Gator Supreme w 
ultraflex Edge 3 X 

6 (52 oz face 
weight 92oz over 

all weight ultra 
flex edging)

Each Gator MAT999GS NO NO 5 $265.00 Hillyard $265.00

A-88

Gator Supreme w 
ultraflex Edge 3 X 

10 (52 oz face 
weight 92oz over 

all weight ultra 
flex edging)

Each Gator MAT999GS NO NO 5 $400.84 Hillyard $400.84



Bid Tab - Custodian Equipment & Consumable Supplies -  2024-2025
Key Accepted Bid Rejected Sample

No Subs 
Allowed

Item# Item Description U/M BRAND PROD #
Sub 

Allowed
Sample 
Required

EST. QTY Per Item ATS Brady Plus Buckeye Cambridge Clayton Paper HD Supply Hillyard Imperial Bag Interboro Packing Nu-Life Labs, Inc. Pacific Star Office Products Alliance Pur-O-Zone Pyramid School Products Royal Paper
Vendor Accepted 

Bid
Vendor Accepted $

A-89

Gator Supreme w 
ultraflex Edge 4 X 

6 (52 oz face 
weight 92oz over 

all weight ultra 
flex edging)

Each Gator MAT999GS NO NO 5 $316.56 Hillyard $316.56

A-90

Gator Supreme w 
ultraflex Edge 6 X 

6 (52 oz face 
weight 92oz over 

all weight ultra 
flex edging)

Each Gator MAT999GS NO NO 5 $444.00 Hillyard $444.00

A-91

Gator Supreme w 
ultraflex Edge 6 X 

8 (52 oz face 
weight 92oz over 

all weight ultra 
flex edging)

Each Gator MAT999GS NO NO 5 $571.44 Hillyard $571.44

A-92

Gator Supreme w 
ultraflex Edge 6 X 

10 (52 oz face 
weight 92oz over 

all weight ultra 
flex edging)

Each Gator MAT999GS NO NO 5 $698.88 Hillyard $698.88

A-93

Gator Supreme w 
ultraflex Edge 8 X 

10 (52 oz face 
weight 92oz over 

all weight ultra 
flex edging)

Each Gator MAT999GS NO NO 5 $897.56 Hillyard $897.56

A-94

Gator Supreme w 
ultraflex Edge 8 X 

12 (52 oz face 
weight 92oz over 

all weight ultra 
flex edging)

Each Gator MAT999GS NO NO 5 $1,060.63 Hillyard $1,060.63

A-95
Gator SupremeTile 

19.69 x 19.69 Case Gator MATMTILESSN NO NO 5 $199.98 Hillyard $199.98

Personal Protection Signage & Equipment 0
Signage 0

A-96
Caution Wet Floor 

Sign
Each Impact 9152BH YES YES 50 $5.74 $10.02 IP9152BH - 

$10.29
By Case of 6 
only - $47.42

NLKANYVWFS - 
$6.99/each

ABCO WS0001 - 10 
eac/case full cases 

only - $7.99
$9.38

ATS, Nu-Life 
Labs, Inc. & 

Pyramid 
School 

Products

$5.74, $6.99 & 
$7.99

Personal Protection Equipment/GLOVES 0

A-97
Gloves - Nitrile 

Powder Free 
10bx/cs

Cs/10Bx Small YES YES 80 $296.56 SAGLN6 - $32.90 $34.84
Blue or Black 

Microdot Brand - 
$29.95/case

NF201 - 
$23.45

Part Number 
HIL30410 - 

$34.50
NPFG - $25.80

S-HONGRAYNU 
57023 - $25.77

/case

STRGN402 - 
$28.69

Hospeco 
GLN103FSM - 

$39.90
$33.75

Clayton 
Paper, 

Interboro 
Packing & 

Nu-Life Labs, 
Inc.

$23.45, $25.80 
& $25.77

A-98
Gloves - Nitrile 

Powder Free 
10bx/cs

Cs/10Bx Medium YES YES 125 $463.38 SAGLN3 - $32.90 $34.84
Blue or Black 

Microdot Brand - 
$29.95/case

NF202 - 
$23.45

Part Number 
HIL30411 - 

$34.45
NPFG - $25.80

M-
HONGRAYNVS7
023 - $25.77/case

STRGN403 - 
$28.69

Hospeco 
GLN103FM -$39.90 $33.75

Clayton 
Paper, 

Interboro 
Packing & 

Nu-Life Labs, 
Inc.

$23.45, $25.80 
& $25.77

A-99
Gloves - Nitrile 

Powder Free 
10bx/cs

Cs/10Bx LARGE YES YES 170 $630.19 SAGLN4 - $32.90 $34.84
Blue or Black 

Microdot Brand - 
$29.95/case

NF203 - 
$23.45

Part Number 
HIL30412 - 

$34.45
NPFG - $25.80

L-
HONGRAYNVS7
023 - $25.77/case

STRGN404 - 
$28.69

Hospeco 
GLN103FL -$39.90 $33.75

Clayton 
Paper, 

Interboro 
Packing & 

Nu-Life Labs, 
Inc.

$23.45, $25.80 
& $25.77

A-100
Gloves - Nitrile 

Powder Free 
10bx/cs

Cs/10Bx X-Large YES YES 150 $646.80 SAGLN5 - $32.90 $34.84
Blue or Black 

Microdot Brand - 
$29.95/case

NF204 - 
$23.45

Part Number 
HIL30413 - 

$34.45
NPFG - $25.80

XL-
HONGRAYNVS7
023 - $25.77/case

STRGN405 - 
$28.69

Hospeco 
GLN103FXL 

-$39.90
$33.75

Clayton 
Paper, 

Interboro 
Packing & 

Nu-Life Labs, 
Inc.

$23.45, $25.80 
& $25.77

A-101
Gloves, Disposable 

- Vinyl only - 
powder free

Cs/10Bx Small YES YES 40 $88.00 SAGLV11 - $19.10 $23.49 VF001 - 
$17.60

Part Number 
HIL30485 - 

$19.90
VPFG - $17.70 TGNM700S - 

$17.90/case
STRGVC02 - 

$18.05

Hospeco VPF232 - 
$29.90

$23.75

Brady Plus, 
Clayton 

Paper, Nu-
Life Labs, 

Inc. & Office 
Products 
Alliance

$19.10, $17.60, 
$17.90 & 

$18.05

A-102
Gloves, Disposable 

- Vinyl only - 
powder free

Cs/10Bx Medium YES YES 60 $132.00 SAGLV12 - $19.10 $23.49 VF002 - 
$17.60

Part Number 
HIL30486 - 

$19.90
VPFG - $17.70 TGNM700M - 

$17.90/case
STRGVC03 - 

$18.05

Hospeco VPF235 - 
$29.90

$23.75

Brady Plus, 
Clayton 

Paper, Nu-
Life Labs, 

Inc. & Office 
Products 
Alliance

$19.10, $17.60, 
$17.90 & 

$18.05

A-103
Gloves, Disposable 

- Vinyl only - 
powder free

Cs/10Bx Large YES YES 85 $187.00 SAGLV13 - $19.10 $23.49 VF003 - 
$17.60

Part Number 
HIL30487 - 

$19.90
VPFG - $17.70 TGNM700L - 

$17.90/case
STRGVC04 - 

$18.05

Hospeco VPF236 - 
$29.90

$23.75

Brady Plus, 
Clayton 

Paper, Nu-
Life Labs, 

Inc. & Office 
Products 
Alliance

$19.10, $17.60, 
$17.90 & 

$18.05



Bid Tab - Custodian Equipment & Consumable Supplies -  2024-2025
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A-104
Gloves, Disposable 

- Vinyl only - 
powder free

Cs/10Bx X-Large YES YES 85 $187.00 SAGLV14 - $19.10 $23.49 VF004 - 
$17.60

Part Number 
HIL30488 - 

$19.90
VPFG - $17.70 TGNM700XL - 

$17.90/case
STRGVC05 - 

$18.05

Hospeco VPF238 - 
$29.90

$23.75

Brady Plus, 
Clayton 

Paper, Nu-
Life Labs, 

Inc. & Office 
Products 
Alliance

$19.10, $17.60, 
$17.90 & 

$18.05

Toilet Paper/Paper Towels & Dispensers 0
Paper Towels & Dispensers 0

A-105 Towels, Multifold Case General 1508 YES YES 40 $29.28 MORR720 - 
$14.84

Part Number 
PAP10135 - 

$27.50

GEN, G1508, 16/ct 
- $48.95

NPMMFN4000 - 
$18.58 RPMFK - $18.55

Clayton 
Paper, 

Hillyard, 
Office 

Products 
Alliance & 

Royal Paper

$14.84, $27.50, 
$18.58 & 

$18.55

A-106 Towels, Singlefold Case General 1507 YES YES 20 $26.46
Part Number 
PAP47000 - 

$27.70

GEN, G1507, 16/ct 
- $53.95

NPMP600N - 
$21.09 SCSK1850A - $22.67

ATS, Hillyard, 
Office 

Products 
Alliance & 

Royal Paper

$26.46, $27.70, 
$21.09 & 

$22.67

A-107
Vondrehle Paper 

Towels; Preserve® 
- 7.9" x 800' 

Case Vondrehle VDC 88O-N YES YES 4,130 MORR6800 - 
$18.54

GEN1825 8" x 
800' - $23.47

REHWT800K - 
$25.59/case

NPM6800EN - 
$19.21 RPRLKR-800 - $23.84

Clayton 
Paper, 

Hillyard, 
Office 

Products 
Alliance & 

Royal Paper

$18.54, $23.47, 
$19.21 & 

$23.84

A-108
Vondrehle Paper 
Towel Dispenser

Each Vondrehle VDC8864 YES YES 3,050 76103-Sterling - 
$57.39/each NPM8864 - $42.00

Nu-Life Labs, 
Inc. & Office 

Products 
Alliance

57.39 & $42

Toilet Tissue & Dispensers 305

A-109
Toilet Tissue 2 ply 

rolls(96 rolls)
Case General 201 YES YES 505 $50.77 $50.89 NPS12325 - 

$34.74

Part Number 
WSI2240B - 

$53.16
$34.99/case NPM9650033U - 

$38.14 RPTP-2-SEL - $44.77

Clayton 
Paper & Nu-
Life Labs, 

Inc.

$34.74 & 
$34.99

A-110
Dispenser, TP, 

Double roll
Each Impact 2501 YES YES 40 $12.65 IP250 - $9.87 Case of 12 - 

$267.54
Impact, 2501, 12/pk 

- $319.17 IMP2500 - $11.14 12/cases Full Case 
- $20.98 $15.63

ATS, Clayton 
Paper, Office 

Products 
Alliance & 

Royal Paper

$12.65, $9.87, 
$11.14 & 
$15.63

A-111
Dispenser, TP, 

Single roll
Each Impact 2500 YES YES 40 $6.23 IP2500 - 

$18.84
Case of 12 - 

$116.22
Impact, 2500, 12/pk 

- $187.61 IMP2501 - $23.36 12/cases Full Case 
- $10.99/each $9.38

ATS, Clayton 
Paper & 

Royal Paper

$6.23, $18.84 
& 9.38

A-112
Jumbo Roll Tissue; 
Preserve® - 3.54" x 

1000'
Case Vondrehle VDC 1209 YES YES 100 MORM99 - 

$24.93

Part Number 
GENJRT1000 - 

$35.54

RPJT10002Y - 
$24.59/case NPM5216 - $24.67 RPJRT-2-SEL - $25.52

Clayton 
Paper,  Nu-
Life Labs, 
Inc., Office 
Products 
Alliance & 

Royal Paper

$24.93, $24.59, 
$24.67 & 

$25.52

A-113
Twin Jumbo Roll 
Tissue Dispenser

Case Vondrehle VDC 3253 YES YES 100 7611 - $20.87
/each NPM3253 - $18.70

Ni-Life Labs, 
Inc. & Office 

Products 
Alliance

$20.87 & 
$18.70

Can Liners 0

A-110
Liners, HD 30" x 
36" 8 mic. 10 Gal 

Graphite Black
CS/500 Gateway Liners 400769 YES YES 500 $34.77 MR30370MC 

- $17.19

Part Number 
LH30378N - 

$21.68

Pitt INT-3037 - 
$13.98

NAPK303600K - 
$14.89

Clayton. 
Interboro 

Packing & 
Office 

Products 
Alliance

$17.19, $13.98 
& $14.89

A-111
Liners, 28" x 43" LL 
6 mil, 23 Gal R-Fit 

Clear
CS/250 Gateway Liners 407594 YES YES 500 $17.60 $31.23 P4430XC - 

$10.90

Part Number 
LL2844100C - 

$29.87

Pitt INT-2843 - 
$10.82

NAPRST28436C - 
$16.68

ATS, Clayton 
Paper & 
Office 

Products 
Alliance

$17.60, $10.90 
& $16.68

A-112
Liners, 30"x 37" hi 

density 16 mic.
CS/500 Pitt MRS9285MC NO NO 1,660 $19.13 MR59285MC 

- $33.44

Part Number 
LHI303716N - 

$19.98
$33.56

Pitt 
MRS9285MC - 

$25.64

NAPR303716N - 
$30.59

ATS, Clayton 
Paper & 
Interboro 
Packing

19.13, $33.44 
& $25.64

A-113
Liners, 30"x 37" hi 

density 16 mic.
CS/500 YES YES 1,200 MR59285MC 

- $33.44

Part Number 
LHI303716N - 

$19.98

Pitt INT-3037- 
XH - $27.24

NAPR303716K - 
$30.59

Clayton 
Paper, 

Hillyard & 
Office 

Products 
Alliance

$33.44, $19.98 
& $30.59

A-114
Liners, 40"x48" hi 

density 16 mic.
CS/250 Pitt MR40483MK NO NO 1,200 $38.38 MR40483MC 

- $26.19

Part Number 
LHI404816N - 

$21.81
$26.98

Pitt 
MR40483MK - 

$23.34

NAPR404816K - 
$26.46

Clayton & 
Interboro 
Packing

$26.19 & 
$23.34

A-115
Liners, 40"x48" hi 

density 16 mic.
CS/250 YES YES 1,200 MR40483MC 

- $26.19

Part Number 
LHI404816N - 

$21.81

Pitt INT - 4048-
XH - $23.32

NAPR404816N - 
$26.46

Clayton 
Paper, 

Hillyard & 
Interboro 
Packing

$26.19, $21.81 
& $23.32
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A-116
Liners, 40" x 53" 
1.0 mil, 55 Gal R-

Fit Black
CS/100 Gateway Lines 407144 YES YES 1,000 $39.40 $36.49 EC415412K - 

$17.14

Part Number 
LX5525C - 

$37.64

Pitt INT-4053-
XXH - $15.72

NAPRB40531B - 
$15.58

Clayton 
Paper, 

Interboro 
Packing & 

Office 
Products 
Alliance

$17.14,   
$15.72 & 

$15.58

A-117
Liners, 40" x 53" 
1.2 mil, 55 Gal R-

Fit Clear
CS/100 Gateway Liners 407279 YES YES 50 $43.49 P5435XC - 

$18.92

Part Number 
LX5530M - 

$31.54

Pitt INT - 4053-
XXH - $19.84

NAPRST405312C - 
$22.26

Clayton 
Paper, 

Hillyard & 
Office 

Products 
Alliance

$18.92, $31.54 
& $22.26

Waste Management 0
Receptacle-Dolly, Container, & Lid 0

A-118
Waste Receptacle, 

55 gal.
Each Continental 5500GY NO NO 62 $82.50 CO550064 - 

$79.90

Part Number 
RUB2655GY - 

$95.47

WMPRH5555G - 
$79.99 or 

Rubbermaid 
RCP265500GY - 

$99.89/each

RMFG265500GRAY - 
$62.69

Clayton 
Paper & 

Royal Paper

$79.90 & 
$62.69

A-119
Waste Receptacle, 

Dolly
Each Continental 3255 NO NO 87 $51.12 CO3255 - 

$27.55

Part Number 
RUB2640BK - 

$58.47

Rubbermaid 
FG2640 - 2/cases 
Full cases only - 

$30.99

RMFG264000BLA - 
$34.29

Clayton 
Paper & 
Pyramid 
School 

Products

$27.55 & 30.99

A-120
Waste Receptacle, 

25 gal. Square 
Grey

Each Continental CO25GY NO NO 50 CO256Y - 
$55.40

Part Number 
RUB356988GY 

- $80.76

RMPG356988GRAY - 
$42.37

Clayton 
Paper & 

Royal Paper
$55.40 & 42.37

A-121
Round Trash Cans 

- 44QT
Each Rubbermaid RCP2947GRA NO NO 50 BCP2947GR

A - $23.37

By Case only 
RUB2947GY - 

$135.22
$15.50

Rubbermaid, 
FG294700GRAY, 

each - $26.06

12/cases full cases 
only - $19.99

RMPG244700GRAY - 
$15.37

Imperial Bag 
& Royal 
Paper

$15.50 & 
$15.37

Sanitary-Equipment Liners & Supplies 0 0+

A-122

Kraft Wax Paper 
Liners, Brown -  
500/cs - (7-1/2 

Inch L x 3-1/2 Inch 
W x 10-1/4 Inch D)

Case of 500 Hospeco KL260 YES YES 40 $20.82 KL - $18.50 HSKL260 - 
$18.59 $24.28 $19.82 KL260 - $19.99 Hospeco, HOSKL, 

500/ct - $41.56
HOSKL260 - 

$18.26 $21.98 HSKL - $21.34

Brady Plus, 
Clayton 
Paper & 
Office 

Products 
Alliance

$18.50, $18.59 
& $18.26

A-123
Waxed Paper 

Liners
Case of 500 YES YES 55 $31.89 HSKL260 - 

$18.59

Part Number 
HOS260 - 

$22.85
RC77L500 - $26.83 Clayton 

Paper $18.59

A-124

Liners, paper 
250/cs - 10 x 9 x 

3.25 inches (H x W 
x D)

Case of 250 Hospeco 6141 YES YES 20 $17.18 HS-6141 - $15.17 HS6141 - 
$17.94 $25.45 $17.52 6141 - $18.99 Hospeco, 6141, 

250/ct - $34.39
HOSHS6141 - 

$15.18 $18.98 HSH86141 - $17.56

ATS, Brady 
Plus & Office 

Products 
Alliance

$17.18, $15.17 
& $15.18

Outdoor Supplies 0

A-125

American Flag 4' X 
6' heavy duty  
outdoor nylon, 

Embroidered

Each YES YES 10 $59.18 AUTMBE002
220 - $59.90

Valley Forge 
1200500 - $29.98 PHAMF 4X6 - $74.70

ATS & 
Pyramid 
School 

Products

$59.18 & 
$29.98

Addendum# 2

Tork Paper 
Towel Roll 
(that fits in 
Tork 
Dispenser 
PeakServe) 

Case Tork NO NO 4,000

105065 - $42.69
/case (Price 

Guaranteed until 
1/31/2025)

SCA105065 - 
$46.05 105065 - $48.80 105065 - $49.40 (Prices 

good through 1/31/25)
Brady Plus & 

Hillyard
$42.69 & 

$46.05

Addendum# 2

Tork 
Dispenser - 
Paper Towel 
PeakServe 

Each Tork NO NO 3,000
552528 - $0 

(Provided at No 
Charge)

SCA552528 - 
No Charge

552538 - 
$18/each No Charge Brady Plus & 

Hillyard No Charge

Addendum# 3
Tork DVC 
Jumbo Bath 
2 PLY 12/751 

Case Tork NO NO 2,500

12024402 - $32.05
/case (Price 

Guaranteed until 
1/31/2025)

SCA12024402 - 
$34.56 12024402 - $42

11020602 - $46.12 
(Prices good through 

1/31/25)

Brady Plus & 
Hillyard

$32.05 & 
$34.56

Addendum# 3

Tork 
Dispenser - 
Jumbo Toilet 
Tissue

Each Tork NO NO 3,500
5555290 $0 

(Provided at No 
Charge)

SCA401215 - 
No Charge

5555290 - 
$10/each No Charge Brady Plus & 

Hillyard No Charge

Tork Prem 
Antibact Foam 

Soap 
Case Tork SCA401215 - 

$53.98
Hillyard $53.98

Tork Skincare 
Dispenser

Case Tork
SCA571508 - 

No Charge Hillyard No Charge


